%ﬂ-’-——"
%’man Phil Mendelson

Bill 25-787, “Fiscal Year 2024 Revised Local Budget Emergency Act of 2024”
Bill 25-788, “Fiscal Year 2024 Revised Local Budget Temporary Act of 2024”
(ANS)

June 12,2024

AN AMENDMENT

1. Section 2 is amended by adding a new subsection (d) to read as follows:
“(d) Paragraph (5) under the heading Governmental Direction and Support in section 2 of
the Fiscal Year 2024 Local Budget Act of 2023, effective August 29, 2023 (D.C. Law 25-47; 70
DCR 9700), is amended by striking the figure “$45,000” and inserting the figure “$150,000” in

its place.”.

2. A new section 2a is added to read as follows:

“Sec. 2a. Section 1 of An Act To authorize funds for ceremonies in the District of
Columbia, approved July 11, 1947 (61 Stat. 314, D.C. Official Code § 1-333.09), is amended as
follows:

“(a) Subsection (a) is amended by striking the figure “$100,000” and inserting the figure
“$150,000” in its place.

“(b) Subsection (b) is amended by striking the figure “$100,000” and inserting the figure

“$150,000” in its place.”.

Rationale: Later this month | am hosting a reception for state legislators under the auspices of the
National Conference of State Legislatures (NCSL). In September | will be hosting a conference for
large city council presidents under the auspices of the National League of Cities. Also, this yearitis
the Council’s turn to host the District’s Congressional Black Caucus reception. This amendment
increases the budget authority provided for the Chairman’s discretionary fund from already
appropriated funds. This, in turn, facilitates the hosting of these events.



%ﬂ-’-——"
%’man Phil Mendelson

Bill 25-787, “Fiscal Year 2024 Revised Local Budget Emergency Act of 2024”
Bill 25-788, “Fiscal Year 2024 Revised Local Budget Temporary Act of 2024”
(ANS)

June 12,2024

AN AMENDMENT

1. Section 2 is amended by adding a new subsection (d) to read as follows:
“(d) Paragraph (5) under the heading Governmental Direction and Support in section 2 of
the Fiscal Year 2024 Local Budget Act of 2023, effective August 29, 2023 (D.C. Law 25-47; 70
DCR 9700), is amended by striking the figure “$45,000” and inserting the figure “$150,000” in

its place.”.

2. A new section 2a is added to read as follows:

“Sec. 2a. Section 1 of An Act To authorize funds for ceremonies in the District of
Columbia, approved July 11, 1947 (61 Stat. 314, D.C. Official Code § 1-333.09), is amended as
follows:

“(a) Subsection (a) is amended by striking the figure “$100,000” and inserting the figure
“$150,000” in its place.

“(b) Subsection (b) is amended by striking the figure “$100,000” and inserting the figure

“$150,000” in its place.”.

Rationale: Later this month | am hosting a reception for state legislators under the auspices of the
National Conference of State Legislatures (NCSL). In September | will be hosting a conference for
large city council presidents under the auspices of the National League of Cities. Also, this yearitis
the Council’s turn to host the District’s Congressional Black Caucus reception. This amendment
increases the budget authority provided for the Chairman’s discretionary fund from already
appropriated funds. This, in turn, facilitates the hosting of these events.



